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To: Gina Scalese <Gscalese@bursey.org>
From: Christine Baker <christine@highdesertpermaculture.org>
Subject: RE: Midland Funding v. Christine Baker CV   2012-1251 UN
Cc:
Bcc:
Attached: 

Ok, I will email to you too,

Christine

At 11:06 AM 11/17/2012, you wrote:
You’re welcome. I saw somewhere in our notes that you prefer e-mail so that’s the way I’ll send you any
documents that we file – I don’t like to put your e-mail address on the mailing page due for privacy reasons. You
can also e-mail any docs that you file directly to me or Monica, or litigation@bursey.org. Thank you.
 
Gina Scalese, Paralegal
Bursey & Associates, PC
6740 N. Oracle Rd., #151
Tucson, AZ 85704
520-529-3600, ext. 147
gscalese@bursey.org
 
This is an attempt to collect a debt and any information obtained will be used for that purpose only.

From: Christine Baker [mailto:christine@highdesertpermaculture.org]
Sent: Saturday, November 17, 2012 11:03 AM
To: Gina Scalese
Subject: RE: Midland Funding v. Christine Baker CV 2012-1251 UN
 
Thank you, got the motion.  You don't need to snail mail filings that you email to me,

Christine Baker

At 05:13 PM 11/16/2012, you wrote:

Ms. Baker,
Attached please find a copy of Plaintiff?s Notice of No Objection to your Motion to Continue Trial. It was sent out for filing
today. I will follow-up with the Court and let you know when there is a ruling. Thank you.
 

Gina Scalese, Paralegal
Bursey & Associates, PC
6740 N. Oracle Rd., #151
Tucson, AZ 85704
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520-529-3600, ext. 147
gscalese@bursey.org
 
This is an attempt to collect a debt and any information obtained will be used for that purpose only.

From: Christine Baker [ mailto:christine@highdesertpermaculture.org]
Sent: Thursday, November 15, 2012 7:05 PM
To: Gina Scalese
Subject: Re: Midland Funding v. Christine Baker CV 2012-1251 UN
 
Ms. Scalese,

I included my request to continue the trial hearing with my Motion for Leave to Amend ... "AND
REQUEST FOR CONTINUANCE OF TRIAL HEARING." I don't think 30 - 60 days is enough time as I
have more discovery to conduct and I am not happy with the lack of responses to my previous
discovery requests.

You might want to call the court to find out whether the judge already continued the trial hearing, my
motions were delivered to the court on Monday.

Christine Baker

At 04:27 PM 11/15/2012, you wrote:

Ms. Baker,
Yesterday we received your Response in Opposition to Motion to Dismiss Counterclaim, Motion for Leave to
Amend Answer and Counterclaim. We have a trial coming up on November 26, 2012. We believe it would be
mutually beneficial for the parties to continue the Trial to allow additional time to prepare, especially with the
upcoming holiday. Will you agree to a 30-60 day continuance? If so, do we have your permission to sign a
Stipulation to Continue and file it with the Court as soon as possible. Please contact me at your earliest
convenience to advise. Thank you.
 
Gina Scalese, Paralegal
Bursey & Associates, PC
6740 N. Oracle Rd., #151
Tucson, AZ 85704
520-529-3600, ext. 147
gscalese@bursey.org
 
This is an attempt to collect a debt and any information obtained will be used for that purpose only.

From: Christine Baker [ mailto:christine@highdesertpermaculture.org]
Sent: Monday, November 12, 2012 11:04 AM
To: Gina Scalese
Subject: RE: Exhibit 1 -- Midland Funding v. Christine Baker CV 2012-1251 UN
 
Thank you, I finally did receive exhibit 1.  However, I already mailed my response to the court on
Saturday.
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Christine Baker

At 08:22 AM 11/12/2012, you wrote:

I apologize for the difficulty in getting this to you. Please confirm receipt. Thank you.
 
Gina Scalese, Paralegal
Bursey & Associates, PC
6740 N. Oracle Rd., #151
Tucson, AZ 85704
520-529-3600, ext. 147
gscalese@bursey.org

From: Christine Baker [ mailto:christine@highdesertpermaculture.org]
Sent: Friday, November 09, 2012 6:34 PM
To: Gina Scalese
Subject: Re: Exhibit 1 -- Midland Funding v. Christine Baker CV 2012-1251 UN
 
Ms. Scalese,

Nothing was attached.

Christine Baker

At 10:51 AM 11/9/2012, you wrote:

Ms. Baker,
Attached please find a copy of Exhibit 1 to our Motion to Dismiss Counterclaim. I apologize that it was not
attached in the copy you received. Please contact me if you have any questions.
 
 
Gina Scalese, Paralegal
Bursey & Associates, PC
6740 N. Oracle Rd., #151
Tucson, AZ 85704
520-529-3600, ext. 147
gscalese@bursey.org
 
 
This communication is an attempt to collect a debt and any information obtained will be used for that
purpose only.
 




